
 
 
 

 
 
 
 

 
Freedom of Information Request – 3616 

 
I am a freelance journalist looking into maternal healthcare in UK health trusts and boards a year on from a report by the All-Party 
Parliamentary Group on Birth Trauma. 
 
2. How many vacancies do you currently have for a) midwives; b) obstetricians? (And how many members of staff do you 
currently have in both those roles?) 
 

Midwives = 4.20 WTE   104.65 WTE Staff in post 
Obs & Gynae drs = 0.40 WTE 32.88 WTE Staff in post 
 
Unable to breakdown further to gynaecologist / obstetricians 
 

3. What is the number of stillbirths and neonatal deaths recorded in your trust/board in each of the past 10 years? And what was 
the recorded ethnicity of those who died, if the data is available? 
 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
 
 

 
We have not broken this down by ethnicity due to the low numbers involved. This reduces the risk of identification. This is a partial exemption 
covered under Section 40 of the Act.  
 
We have provided as many years as possible. Some records on our maternity system only go back to 2019.  
 
3. How many live births were recorded at your trust/board in each of the past 10 years? 
 

Year Total Babies 

2019 1859 

2020 1836 

2021 1763 

2022 1790 

2023 1759 

2024 1624 

2025 779 

 
We have provided as many years as possible. Some records on our maternity system only go back to 2019.  
 
4. What is the number of maternal deaths recorded in your trust/board in each of the past 10 years? And what was the recorded 
ethnicity of those who died? 
 

Year Total Deaths 

2017 1 

2018 2 

2024 1 

 
We have provided as much data as we have available.  
 
 
5. How many medical negligence suits have arisen from incidents in your maternity department in each of the past 10 years?  
 

Notification Year 
No. of 
Claims 

2015/16 
Fewer than 
5 

2016/17 
Fewer than 
5 

2017/18 
Fewer than 
5 

2018/19 6 

2019/20 
Fewer than 
5 

2020/21 
Fewer than 
5 

2021/22 5 

2022/23 
Fewer than 
5 

2023/24 5 

Year Early neonatal death Stillbirth 

2019 1 9 

2020 1 9 

2021   6 

2022   8 

2023 2 9 

2024 2 2 

2025   2 

https://www.theo-clarke.org.uk/files/2024-05/Birth%20Trauma%20Inquiry%20Report%20for%20Publication_May13_2024.pdf
https://www.theo-clarke.org.uk/files/2024-05/Birth%20Trauma%20Inquiry%20Report%20for%20Publication_May13_2024.pdf


2024/25 
Fewer than 
5 

  
  
 
How many resulted in a payment being made, and how much was paid out in each of the past 10 years? 
  

Year of Closure 
(Settlement Year for 
PPO's) No. of Claims Damages Paid 

NHS Legal Costs 
Paid 

Claimant Legal Costs 
Paid 

2015/16 0 0.00 0.00 0.00 

2016/17 0 0.00 0.00 0.00 

2017/18 0 0.00 0.00 0.00 

2018/19 Fewer than 5 Less than 30,000 Less than 10,000 Less than 50,000 

2019/20 Fewer than 5 Less than 60,000 Less than 10,000 Less than 50,000 

2020/21 Fewer than 5 Less than 60,000 Less than 10,000 Less than 50,000 

2021/22 Fewer than 5 Less than 70,000 Less than 30,000 Less than 120,000 

2022/23 Fewer than 5 Less than 1,200,000 Less than 60,000 Less than 240,000 

2023/24 Fewer than 5 Less than 1,500,000 Less than 50,000 Less than 260,000 

2024/25 Fewer than 5 Less than 9,000,000 Less than 200,000 Less than 550,000 

 
 
Due to the low number of medical negligence suits reported we have applied a partial exemption – Section 40(2) – Personal Information to this 
information. This is to reduce the risk of identification.  
 
6. How many third- and fourth-degree tears have you recorded for each of the past 10 years? 
 

Year 3rd degree tear (Mothers) 4th degree tear (Mothers) 

2019 35 2 

2020 14 1 

2021 21   

2022 14 1 

2023 14 1 

2024 16   

2025 11   

 
We have provided as many years as possible. Some records on our maternity system only go back to 2019. 
 
7. What are your current rates of forceps use, if you keep data on this? 
 

Year Forceps Total Mothers Delivered Rate 

2019 104 1847 5.63% 

2020 129 1824 7.07% 

2021 81 1752 4.62% 

2022 85 1773 4.79% 

2023 116 1745 6.65% 

2024 95 1606 5.92% 

2025 51 773 6.60% 

  
We have provided as many years as possible. Some records on our maternity system only go back to 2019. 
 
8. What are your current rates of ventouse assisted deliveries, if you keep data on this? 
 

Year Ventouse Assisted Deliveries Total Mothers Delivered Rate 

2019 61 1847 3.30% 

2020 46 1824 2.52% 

2021 72 1752 4.11% 

2022 51 1773 2.88% 

2023 53 1745 3.04% 

2024 56 1606 3.49% 

2025 26 773 3.36% 

    

Note: Includes forceps (failed vacuum extraction), vacuum extraction (failed forceps), and vacuum extraction. 
 
We have provided as many years as possible. Some records on our maternity system only go back to 2019. 
 
9. How many emergency caesarean sections have you carried out in each of the past 10 years? 
 

Year Total Mothers Delivered 

2019 363 

2020 373 

2021 340 

2022 369 

2023 412 

2024 384 

2025 212 

 
We have provided as many years as possible. Some records on our maternity system only go back to 2019. 



 
10. How many Maternal Request Caesareans were made to staff in each of the past 10 years, and how many were approved? 
Information not recorded. However, the Trust is supportive of maternal request caesarean sections in line with NICE guidance.  
 
11. How much did your trust/board pay for use of interpreters in its maternity department in each of the past 10 years? 
Information not available. We do not record to this level of detail.   
 
This is the past five years of overall translation spend: 
 
FY 20/21 £37,352 
FY 21/22 £46,680 
FY 22/23 £71,501 
FY 23/24 £85,671 
FY 24/25 £94,959 
 
12. How many people have received treatment as part of any MMHS (Maternal Mental Health Service) in the past year? 
This information is not held You may be able to request figures from Wellbeing Service & Perinatal Mental Health Service.  
 
The in-house team of specialist midwives (Eden Team) provides support for women & birthing people with social and/or mental health 
vulnerabilities if they wish. 
 
13. How many people are on the waiting list to receive treatment from the MMHS right now? And how long is the average waiting 
time for treatment? 
Information not held. You may be able to request figures from Wellbeing Service and Perinatal Mental Health Service.  
 
For those utilising Eden Team, there is no waiting list.  


