
 
 

 
 
 

 
Freedom of Information Request - 4223 

  
 

I’m requesting information under the Freedom of Information Act 2000.   
 
1.     For the period 1st Oct – 31st Dec 2017 please could you tell me how many FTE 
 (full time equivalent) nursing/midwifery personnel were employed by your 
 trust? 815.51 fte Reg. N&M Staff 
 
2.     For the period 1st Oct – 31st Dec 2017 please could you tell me how many of those 

FTE nursing/midwifery personnel were male? 82.33 fte 
 

3.     For the period 1st Oct – 31st Dec 2017 please can you tell me how many FTE 
healthcare assistants were employed by your trust?  

 262.91 fte (healthcare assistant role only, excludes other clinical support type roles) 
 
4.     For the period 1st Oct – 31st Dec 2017 please can you also tell me how many of 

those FTE healthcare assistant were male?  
 27.08 fte 
 
5.     For the period 1st Oct – 31st Dec 2017 please can you also tell me how much you 

spent on CPD (continuing professional development) training for healthcare 
assistants? 

 This information is not held by the Trust 
 
6.     For the period 1st Oct – 31st Dec 2015 please could you tell me how many FTE 

(full time equivalent) nursing/midwifery personnel were employed by your trust? 
 788.72 fte Reg. N&M staff 
 
7.     For the period 1st Oct – 31st Dec 2015 please could you tell me how many of those 

FTE nursing/midwifery personnel were male? 
 89.63 ft 
 
8.     For the period 1st Oct – 31st Dec 2015 please can you tell me how many FTE 

healthcare assistants were employed by your trust? 
 232.58 fte (healthcare assistant role only, excludes other clinical support type roles) 
 
9.     For the period 1st Oct – 31st Dec 2015 please can you also tell me how many of 

those FTE healthcare assistant were male?  
 25.78 fte 
 
10.  For the period 1st Oct – 31st Dec 2015 please can you also tell me how much you 

spent on CPD (continuing professional development) training for healthcare 
assistants? 

 This information is not held by the Trust 
 
 

 


